
From: Crystal Crain
To: Jones, Laurie; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
Subject: FW: Proof of Payment
Date: Tuesday, August 3, 2021 11:51:51 AM
Attachments: SKM_C250i21080213060.pdf

I just wanted to follow up that you received the proof of payment email for
the City of Spencer, docket # CWA-04-2021-0310(b), due to an email issue.

Crystal S. Crain
City Recorder
City of Spencer
P.O. Box 187
Spencer, TN 38585
931-946-2351 ext. 3

-----Original Message-----
From: Crystal Crain <spencertngov@benlomand.net>
Sent: Monday, August 02, 2021 3:01 PM
To: 'R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov' <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>;
'jones.laurie@epa.gov' <jones.laurie@epa.gov>
Cc: 'boringlaw@bledsoe.net' <boringlaw@bledsoe.net>; 'Zeda Hillis'
<zhillis@jchengr.com>
Subject: Proof of Payment

Please see the attachment copy of the cashier's check for proof of payment
for Docket # CWA-04-2021-031(b) in the amount of $17,000.00 to the
Treasurer, United States of America, EPA.

Crystal S. Crain
City Recorder
City of Spencer
P.O. Box 187
Spencer, TN 38585
931-946-2351 ext. 3
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